



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: Woody Invasive Plant Clearing

BID #: 19001

BID OPENING DATE: August 17, 2018 @ 10:00 am

A1)	Cuba Marsh Forest Preserve					
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BID ALT REF. NO.	BID ALTERNATE(S) AMOUNT	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	McGINTY Bros.	✓	✓	1	\$3,041.25	\$57,750.
2	CARDNO. Inc.	✓	✓	1	\$7,000 ⁰⁰	\$72,795 ⁰⁰
3	JH LANDWORKS	✓	1 NOT 2	1	\$2,650 ⁰⁰	\$39,750 ⁰⁰
4	NATIVE RESTORATION SERVICES	✓	✓	1		No Bid
5	TALLGRASS RESTORATIONS	✓	✓	1	\$11,130 ⁰⁰	\$75,750 ⁰⁰
6	ENCAP, INC	✓	✓	1	—	\$112,500 ⁰⁰
7	Pizzo & Assoc.	✓	✓	1		No Bid
8	AES	✓	✓	1	\$4,190 ⁰⁰	\$53,535 ⁰⁰

[Signature]
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

[Signature]
WITNESS

8/17/18
DATE

8/17/2018
DATE



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: Woody Invasive Plant Clearing

BID #: 19001

BID OPENING DATE: August 17, 2018 @ 10:00 am

A1) Cuba Marsh Forest Preserve						
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BID ALT REF. NO.	BID ALTERNATE(S) AMOUNT	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	CLEAN CUT TREE	✓	✓	1	\$ 3,600 ⁰⁰	\$ 72,000 ⁰⁰
2				1		
3				1		
4				1		
5				1		
6				1		
7				1		
8				1		

[Signature]
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

[Signature]
WITNESS

5-17-18
DATE

8/17/2018
DATE



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: Woody Invasive Plant Clearing

BID #: 19001

BID OPENING DATE: August 17, 2018 @ 10:00 am

A2) Exelon & Illinois Beach St Park						
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BID ALT REF. NO.	BID ALTERNATE(S) AMOUNT	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	McGinity Bros.	✓	✓	1		NO BID
				2		
				3		
2	CARMON, Inc.			1		No Bid
				2		
				3		
3	JH LANDWORKS			1		No BID
				2		
				3		
4	NATIVE RESTORATION SERVICES			1		No BID
				2		
				3		
5	TALLENHASS RESTORATIONS			1		No BID
				2		
				3		
6	ENCAP, Inc.			1		No BID
				2		
				3		
7	PIZZO, Assoc			1		No BID
				2		
				3		
8	AES			1		No BID
				2		
				3		

[Signature]
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

8/17/18
DATE

[Signature]
WITNESS

8/17/18
DATE



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: Woody Invasive Plant Clearing

BID #: 19001

BID OPENING DATE: August 17, 2018 @ 10:00 am

A2) Exelon & Illinois Beach St Park <i>- Page 2</i>						
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BID ALT REF. NO.	BID ALTERNATE(S) AMOUNT	BASE BID AMOUNT
9	CLEAN CUT TREE	✓	✓	1	\$18,525.00	\$182,970.00
				2	\$17,955.00	
				3	\$40,755.00	
2				1		
				2		
				3		
3				1		
				2		
				3		
4				1		
				2		
				3		
5				1		
				2		
				3		
6				1		
				2		
				3		
7				1		
				2		
				3		
8				1		
				2		
				3		

[Signature]
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

[Signature]
WITNESS

8-17-18
DATE

8/17/18
DATE



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: Woody Invasive Plant Clearing

BID #: 19001

BID OPENING DATE: August 17, 2018 @ 10:00 am

A3)	Grainger Woods Conserv Preserve			
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	McGINTY Bros.	✓	✓	\$37,308. ⁵⁰
2	CARDNO, Inc.	✓	✓	\$77,331. ¹⁰
3	JH LANDWORKS	✓	✓	No Bid
4	NATIVE RESTORATION SERVICES	✓	✓	\$40,670 ⁰⁰
5	TALLEGRASS RESTORATIONS	✓	✓	\$53,784
6	ENCAP, Inc.	✓	✓	\$50,215 ⁰⁰
7	Pizzozzi's Assoc.	✓	✓	\$35,430 ²¹
8	AES	✓	✓	34,926 ⁴⁰

[Signature]
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

Lili AB

WITNESS

8/17/18
DATE

8/17/2018
DATE

DATE



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: Woody Invasive Plant Clearing

BID #: 19001

BID OPENING DATE: August 17, 2018 @ 10:00 am

A3) Grainger Woods Conserv Preserve				
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BASE BID AMOUNT
9	CLEAN CUT TREES	✓	✓	\$ 49,800 ⁰⁰
2				
3				
4				
5				
6				
7				
8				

[Signature]
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

[Signature]
WITNESS

8-17-18
DATE

8/17/2018
DATE



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: Woody Invasive Plant Clearing

BID #: 19001

BID OPENING DATE: August 17, 2018 @ 10:00 am

REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BID ALT REF. NO.	BID ALTERNATE(S) AMOUNT	BASE BID AMOUNT
A4	Greenbelt Forest Preserve					
1	McGINTY Bros	✓	✓	1	\$3600 ⁰⁰	\$197,372 ⁰⁰ 197,372 \$190,572
2	CARDNO, Inc.	✓	✓	1		No Bid
3	JH LANDWORKS			1		No Bid
4	NATIVE RESTORATION SERVICES			1		No Bid
5	TALLGRASS RESTORATIONS	✓	✓	1	\$29,100.00	\$148,568.00
6	EMCAP, Inc			1		No Bid
7	Pizzo ¹ / ₃ Assoc.			1		No Bid
8	AES			1		No Bid
9	Clean Cut	✓	✓	1	\$2,100.00	\$109,760.00

[Signature]
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

8-17-18
DATE

[Signature]
WITNESS

8/17/18
DATE



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: Woody Invasive Plant Clearing

BID #: 19001

BID OPENING DATE: August 17, 2018 @ 10:00 am

A5)	Lakewood Forest Preserve			
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	McGINTY Bros.	✓	✓	\$78,225 ⁰⁰
2	CARDNO, INC.			No Bid
3	JH LANDWORKS	✓	'	\$42,875 ⁰⁰
4	NATIVE RESTORATION SERVICES	✓	✓	\$131,250 ⁰⁰
5	TALGAMES RESTORATION	✓	✓	\$62,475 ⁰⁰
6	ENCAP, Inc	✓	✓	No Bid
7	Pizzo's, Assoc			No Bid
8	AES	✓	✓	\$48,142 ⁵⁰

[Signature]
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

[Signature]
WITNESS

8/17/18
DATE

8/17/2018
DATE



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: Woody Invasive Plant Clearing

BID #: 19001

BID OPENING DATE: August 17, 2018 @ 10:00 am

A5) Lakewood Forest Preserve				
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BASE BID AMOUNT
9	Clean Cut	✓	✓	\$61,250 ⁰⁰
2				
3				
4				
5				
6				
7				
8				

[Signature]
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

[Signature]
WITNESS

8-17-18
DATE

8/17/2018
DATE



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: Woody Invasive Plant Clearing

BID #: 19001

BID OPENING DATE: August 17, 2018 @ 10:00 am

A6) Middlefork Savanna Forest Preserve						
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BID ALT REF. NO.	BID ALTERNATE(S) AMOUNT	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	McGINTY BROS.			1		No Bid
				2		
2	CARDNO, INC			1		No Bid
				2		
3	JH LANDWORKS			1		No BID
				2		
4	NATIVE RESTORATION SERVICES			1		No BID
				2		
5	TALLGRASS RESTORATIONS			1		No BID
				2		
6	ENCAP, INC.	✓	✓	1	\$10,440.00	\$163,800.00
				2	\$4,000.00	
7	PIZZO & ASSOC.			1		No BID
				2		
8	AES			1		No BID
				2		
9	Clean Cut	✓	✓	1	\$6,840.00	\$106,400.00
				2	1520.00	

[Signature]
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

8/17/18
DATE

[Signature]
WITNESS

8/17/18
DATE



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: Woody Invasive Plant Clearing

BID #: 19001

BID OPENING DATE: August 17, 2018 @ 10:00 am

A7)	Old School Forest Preserve			
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	McGINITY Bros.	✓	✓	\$137,250 ⁰⁰
2	CARDNO, Inc.			No Bid
3	JH LANDWORKS			No Bid
4	NATIVE RESTORATION SERVICES			No Bid
5	TALLGRASS RESTORATIONS	✓	✓	\$97,905 ⁰⁰
6	ENCAP, Inc.			No Bid
7	P. 220 1/2 ASSOC			No Bid
8	AES	✓	✓	\$99,125 ⁰⁰

[Signature]
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE
[Signature]
WITNESS

8/17/18
DATE
8/17/2018
DATE



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: Woody Invasive Plant Clearing

BID #: 19001

BID OPENING DATE: August 17, 2018 @ 10:00 am

A7) Old School Forest Preserve				
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BASE BID AMOUNT
9	Clean Cut	✓	✓	\$83,875 ⁰⁰
2				
3				
4				
5				
6				
7				
8				

[Signature]
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

[Signature]
WITNESS

8/17/18
DATE

8/17/2018
DATE



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: Woody Invasive Plant Clearing

BID #: 19001

BID OPENING DATE: August 17, 2018 @ 10:00 am

A8) Van Patten Forest Preserve						
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BID ALT REF. NO.	BID ALTERNATE(S) AMOUNT	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	McGINTY Bros.	✓	✓	1	\$10,220	\$235,865 ⁰⁰
2	Carano, Inc	✓	✓	1	\$18,135	\$202,763 ⁴⁰
3	JH LANDWORKS			1		NO BID
4	NATIVE RESTORATION SERVICES			1		NO BID
5	TALLGRASS RESTORATIONS			1		NO BID
6	ENCAP, Inc.			1		NO BID
7	Pizzolo's, Assoc.			1		NO BID
8	AES			1	\$11,781.00	\$110,091.80
9	Clean Cut	✓	✓	1	\$12,000.00	\$94,346.00

PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

DATE

WITNESS

DATE

8-17-18

8/17/18



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: Woody Invasive Plant Clearing

BID #: 19001

BID OPENING DATE: August 17, 2018 @ 10:00 am

A9) Captain Daniel Wright Woods Forest Preserve						
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BID ALT REF. NO.	BID ALTERNATE(S) AMOUNT	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	McGINETY Bros.			1		No Bid
2	CAEONO, INC			1		No Bid
3	JH LANDWORKS			1		No Bid
4	NATIVE RESTORATION SERVICES			1		No Bid
5	TALLERASO RESTORATION			1		No Bid
6	ENCAP, INC.			1		No Bid
7	Pizzozzi Assoc.			1		No Bid
8	AES			1		No Bid
9	Clean Cut	✓	✓	1	\$12,075.00	\$175,875.00

[Signature]
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

[Signature]
WITNESS

8-17-18
DATE

~~8/17~~ 8/17/2018
DATE